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Recently, affected by market conditions, the price of L-carnitine 
BASE from mainstream manufacturers has stabilized to around 
USD21-22/KG. It is expected to show a stable trend in the future

FOOD ADDITIVE

Reported by Cynthia & Shea & Livia & Lexie&Oliva&Hannah
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Recently, the "Triple Inactivated Vaccine for Newcastle Disease, 
Avian Influenza, and Avian Adenovirus" jointly developed by 
Guizhou Foster Biotechnology Co., Ltd., a company in Guiyang 
High-tech Zone, and several units has won the national new 
veterinary drug certificate, which also marks the independent 
research and development of Guizhou Province. A "zero" 
breakthrough in new veterinary drugs (biological products for 
veterinary use).
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Threonine: The manufacturer's quotation was adjusted to the 
strong side, and the transaction was good. As prices rise, market 
purchases and sales are active, and end users just need to restock. 
It is expected that threonine prices will be stable to strong in the 
later period.

AMINO ACID

01
According to market news, BASF will shut down the production of 
VA1000 and vitamin E plants in Ludwigshafen, Germany, for 
regular maintenance, which is planned to start at the end of March 
and end at the end of May. The market price of vitamin E stopped 
falling in December and rebounded from a steady jog in January to 
February. Now the rhythm of small steps and fast running has 
basically appeared.
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